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Advisory Alert: Turnaround “apps” for 
the public sector - the Strategy platform 
Introduction 
A successful restructuring process calls for a 
clear action plan. Restructuring activities must 
be objective and analytical – in other words, 
apolitical.  Back in June 2015, we published a 
piece that addressed the need for pragmatic 
and simple solutions to tackle increasingly 
complex problems in Puerto Rico’s public 
sector. These solutions come in the form of 
turnaround “apps” in four platforms for 
executing turnarounds in the public sector, 
and includes: 
  
• Strategy 
• Operations 
• Finance 
• Leadership 

In the next series of articles, we aim to further 
explore the platforms of these turnaround 
“apps” to offer the government constructive 
suggestions on addressing important issues 
and resolving complex economic and service 
issues in the current difficult environment. 
 
The strategy platform 
Every private enterprise has a mission; 
government, too, has a mission, which is 
often defined in local charters and 
constitutions. Current leadership interprets 
the mission, and public policy embodies the 
prioritization and execution. Public policy is 
the strategy of government, but government 
units need to adopt corporate-like strategic 
planning in order to allocate scarce resources 
and manage constituents’ expectations most 
effectively.  

Strategy app #1:   
Determining core services 
Defining government’s core services is at the 
heart of any governmental restructuring 
effort. For example, all governments share a 
common concern for public safety that is 
reflected in the strength of their police and 
fire departments. One or several school 
districts often claim a major portion of the 
local budget but the quality of the educational 
program will vary with the allocation of 
budget dollars, demographic mix of the 
students and the capability of the teachers. 
Infrastructure in the form of roads, bridges 
and buildings, along with related maintenance, 
is generally in the exclusive purview of the 
government unit.  The degree to which other 
services such as health care, sanitation, 
environmental management and business 
regulation should be prioritized is usually 
subject to debate and prevailing political 
sentiment. 
 
But, must government provide services that 
are often available in a community from 
private for-profit or nongovernmental not-
for-profit organizations? In general, 
government units need to engage in a strategic 
assessment that includes a decision framework 
for prioritizing its activities.  
 
The first question to be answered is this: 
What should be included in the government’s 
service offering? 
 
The question can be answered after 
determining if the service is mandated by 
either law or public policy. If yes, the follow-
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innovative in the accounting 
profession. 
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up question is: What level or type of service is 
required? A government must protect the 
safety of the public; what about providing 
security for a local music festival? Is it 
necessary for the police to be called every 
time the fire department is summoned to a 
private residence? The answer to the first 
question might seem simple, but the answer 
to the follow-up question presents some 
challenges. 
 
Governments pride themselves on their 
contributions to the quality of their residents’ 
lives. The more parks, the more summer 
programs, the cleaner the streets, some would 
say, the better. As prioritization becomes less 
clear, the debate can turn political over public 
policy concerning “must-have” versus “want-
to-have” programs. 
 
Strategy app #2:  
Core competencies and priorities 
Having identified the strategic activities of the 
government unit, the next question that needs 
to be answered is: What are the government’s 
core competencies? In other words, what 
activities does this government unit perform 
that are unique to the community, cannot be 
easily imitated or deliver value that is best in 
class?  
 
In the private sector, turnaround specialists 
evaluate business units based on profitability 
and return on investments. The equivalent in 
the public sector is performance metrics that 
evaluate how effectively the program serves 
its purpose. In the category of “must-have” 
programs such as police, fire protection and 
schools, the departments’ effectiveness can be 
evaluated in terms of crime rates, protection 
against property damage, student performance 
and any number of other logical, empirical 
metrics. 
 
How do these departments compare with 
those found in other communities? Is there a 

private sector alternative that can serve as a 
benchmark? There is an order to the analysis 
and economic logic in addressing the 
inefficiencies of the “must-have” programs 
that should be part of a government’s core 
competency before addressing the “want-to-
have” programs. 
 
“Want-to-have” programs can vary from 
community to community and should not be 
assumed to be luxurious extravagances. It is 
often in these programs that public sector 
providers operate as best in class. For 
example, consider a city-sponsored health 
clinic: What is the annual cost of delivering 
the program? How many patients has it seen? 
How many jobs does it provide in the 
community? Has the general health index 
increased? Has absenteeism at work or in the 
schools declined as a result? What are the 
opportunity costs of not providing the 
program? What are the health care alternatives 
within the same and neighboring communities 
for the citizens who use the clinic? The 
evaluation of government’s competency in 
managing this and any other program relies 
on benchmarking its performance against 
private sector alternatives and/or comparable 
programs in other cities.  
 
Services that are nonessential but enriching 
for the community can provide an 
opportunity for a government to perform like 
a business. This is where “profit” can enter 
the public sector picture. Government entities 
should not be precluded from earning profits 
on their activities and creating benefits for 
their constituencies. For example, if the 
recreation department can generate enough 
revenue to cover its expenses from user fees, 
it may be able to offer summer programs to 
disadvantaged youth at little or no cost. 
 
As with any strong business, the “must-have” 
programs should be analyzed and restructured 
in a way that maximizes their efficacy. The 
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“want-to-have” programs often generate 
political conflict that can lead to systemic 
breakdown and inefficiency. Experts 
recognize that the trouble with evaluating 
disparate “want-to-have” programs is that 
there are rarely common criteria around which 
to measure performance or value. The metrics 
for a health care clinic are not comparable to 
those used in evaluating the parks and 
recreation department that manages parade 
permits. The number of citizens served may 
be the most readily identified metric. This 
“for the greater good” approach, however, 
can easily overrun the needs of underserved 
populations.  And in the world of 
performance metrics, the measure of our 
humanity may be the ability to afford social 
programs that help just a few.  
 
The tragedy is when government’s inefficiency 
precludes the ability to deliver an important, 
albeit uneconomic, humanitarian program.  
Nevertheless, to be successful, an appreciation 
of the political and humanitarian landscape is 
required. 
 
In our next article we will talk about 
turnaround “apps” for governments in the 
Operations platform. 
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